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Executive Summary

The Government of the Northwest Territories is now in the process of implementing a mortgage
and loan company for the specific purpose of providing residential mortgage financing in the
Northwest Territories.

The Northwest Territories is currently experiencing a significant shortfall in residential housing for
its occupants. A unit shortfall of approximately 3,000 exists within the territory. This shortfall is
expected to grow as the territory’s economy improves and grows over the next several years. The
Northwest Territories conducted a comprehensive Housing Needs Sutvey  in 1992. The purpose
was to objectively measure the need for public housing and the need for new home ownership
units in every community within the territory. The housing needs survey findings are summarized
in Appendix VI. The survey identified a total of 2,149 households who had housing problems and
had the fkrnily resources to afford better housing. An additional 3,584 households required better
housing but were not currently in a financial position to upgrade.

The primary cause of this housing deficiency is the lack of adequate sources of financing to
facilitate the construction of new housing units. To date the banks have been reluctant to provide
residential mortgage financing in many areas of the territo~ and their participation in this market
is on a very selective basis generally in the major urban centers of the territory.

As the territory continues to grow the need for new housing will increase. The opportunities
presented by the diamond exploration activities and potential new mines plus the implementation
of Nunavut  are expected to increase the need for housing and provide new lending opportunities
for the Northwest Territories Mortgage and Loan Company (NWT-M&LC).

The creation of the NWT-M&LC  will stimulate new residential construction in the region by
providing a new source of financing. This will enhance economic development in the north
through new construction and provide spin off benefits to all sectors of the economy.

The NWT-M&LC is to be incorporated under a regulatory and legislative framework to be
established by the Government of the Northwest Territories. The company will be licensed to
carry on business as a loan company within the Northwest Territories. The NWT-M&LC will
generate a secure stream of income by investing in a portfolio of residential mortgages and other
qualified investments in the territory. The head ofice will be in a major centre in the Northwest
Territories.

The NWT-M&LC  will be capitalized with an initial investment by the Government of the
Northwest Territories. Several private and institutional investors will be involved from the
beginning. A total of $10,000,000 of equity capital will be invested within the first year. The
NWT-M&LC  will employ leverage, as permitted, by issuing debt obligations (term deposits) to a
maximum of five times the book value of equity in the company. These term deposits will be
matched to the term of the mortgage portfolio.



The NWT-M&LC plans to be a member institution in good standing with the Canadian Deposit
Insurance Corporation (CDIC). All deposits subject to the CDIC maximum will be insured.

Sufficient deposits can likely be obtained within the Northwest Territories to provide the capital
required to generate a $120,000,000 mortgage portfolio within 5 years. The NWT-M&LC
intends to offer a premium of approximately ‘/2 % on five year deposits to stimulate investor
interest. The northern residents have a very high savings rate and currently much of these finds
are held in the form of deposits with the same banks that are reluctant to re-invest  in the territory.
This premium combined with a strong public relations and marketing campaign focusing on the
benefits this company provides to the territory should make the company a positive deposit
opportunity for the residents of the Northwest Territories.

The NWT-M&LC intends to qualifi as a mortgage investment corporation under the Income Tax
Act. This obliges the company to distribute all of its net income (for tax purposes) within 90 days
of its year end to the shareholders of the company. This will allow the company to avoid paying
corporate income taxes and thereby provide a larger income stream and return to its shareholders.

The NWT-M&LC will seek equity capital from the private sector which will leverage the equity
investment made by the government. Based on the expected returns and risk we believe that
northern investors will find this an attractive alternative for R.R. S.P. equity investments.
Aboriginal groups, certain institutions, and other private investors are all potential equity
participants.

The NWT-M&LC will develop investment policies which will be approved by the Board of
Directors. These lending policies will be consistent with the CDIC operating guidelines and
consistent with the Canadian Mortgage Housing Corporation (CMHC) regulations.

The NWT-M&LC’s investment policy:

1.

2.

3.

At least three quarters of the NWT-M&LC  assets will be invested in Residential Mortgage
Loans within the Northwest Territories or be held in cash or other permitted deposits.

The balance of the NWT-M&LC’s assets will be invested in other permitted investments
which may include real property, leases on real property and industrial and commercial
mortgage loans within the Northwest Territories.

The NWT-M&LC  will consider residential mortgage financing on public housing projects in
the Northwest Territories provided government leases or guarantees are available.

Expertise will be retained to administer the loan portfolio in accordance with the NWT-M&LC’s
investment policies. Extensive knowledge of the north and residency in the north will be a
prerequisite for the group selected.

This group will be experienced in operating and managing a residential mortgage portfolio. The
group will originate mortgages, administer collections and generally manage the investment
portfolio, subject to the direction of management and the Board of Directors.
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Residential mortgages will be available to all areas of the territory. The company’s activities will
be confined to the Territory. The NWT-M&LC will establish lending guidelines and interest rate
schedules based on the location of the asset and the risk of the individual mortgage investment.
The company will charge a premium over the current conventional mortgage lender. This will
ensure no displacement of existing lenders within the territory will take place and thus provide
incremental mortgage financing to residents of the territory.

The company intends to cooperate with existing lenders and will organize lender consortiums to
finance large projects and /or projects where risk can be minimized by the participation of several
lenders. The company will be very sensitive to the characteristics of the north and will establish a
Northwest Territories based Loan & Business Committee who can properly assess the risk of
each investment from the northern perspective and still maintain a high standard of lending
criteria.

The Government of the Northwest Territories, along with the Federal Government, sees this
vehicle as an excellent method of leveraging government participation in the development of the
north. In this regard, the governments will provide secondary security in the form of government
lease guarantees and other secondary guarantees where appropriate. Specific guarantees will be
established to accommodate projects in the area of public housing. Normal Canadian Mortgage
and Housing Corporation guarantees will be used for lenders who qualifj under its programs.
The CMHC criteria will be expanded by the NWT-M&LC  to ensure maximum guarantees are
sought at all times.

The Government of the Northwest Territories will provide a total of $5,000,000 of equity
financing and will limit its ownership to 25’?40. A total of $15,000,000 to $20,000,000 of equity is
now being sought to provide a capital base for the new NWT-M&LC.  CDIC insurable deposits
will provide the primary source of debt financing.

An experienced team of professionals based in the Northwest Territories will be assembled to
launch this new NWT-M&LC.  The market need is clear. Government support, both territorial
and federally, is now available. This company can be a viable business and will likely evolve to a
fill service trust company or similar financial institution.

This new company will provide significant benefits to the territory in the form of new construction
jobs and additional economic development. This new financing source will help solve a portion of
the housing shortage in the territory and provides significant private sector leverage on the use of
public finds.
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The Northwest Territories

The Northwest Territories encompass the lands north of the sixtieth parallel including the islands
north to Ellesmere  Island. It is bordered on the west by the Yukon and on the east by Hudson
Bay and the Davis Strait.

The total area of the Northwest Territories is 3,376,698 square kilometres  or about one third of
the total area of Canada. Of the total area, land mass accounts for 3,244,608 square kilornetres.

The population of the Northwest Territories in 1990 was estimated at 53,500. Approximately
sixty per cent of the residents are aboriginal people the majority of which are Inuit.

The Northwest Territories Act of 1875 established the legal framework for governing the
Northwest Territories which, with subsequent amendments, still stands as the legal authority for
the Government of the Northwest Territories.

The Government of the Northwest Territories has evolved over the decades to the point where it
is similar in many ways to a provincial government. The evolution has been marked by a steady
transfer of power from the Federal Government to the Government of the Northwest Territories.

The Government of the Northwest Territories has substantially the same revenue raising powers
and expenditure responsibilities as the provincial governments. However, the Northwest
Territories has a relatively smaller and less stable revenue base than most of the provinces. The
per capita cost of delivering essential public services in the Northwest Territories exceeds that of
the provinces because of the large geographic area, low population density, lower level of
ifiastructure,  and higher environmental costs.

Most of the goods produced in the Northwest Territories are sold elsewhere. Mineral mining is
the largest goods producing industry and has historically accounted for ten per cent of the direct
jobs available. Diamond exploration activity in the Northwest Territories has resulted in thirty
million acres of claims during 1993. It is becoming increasingly probable that the Northwest
Territories will host the first diamond-producing mine in North America. This would vastly
increase the role of mining as a direct and indirect generator of employment and income.

The 1989 Northwest Territories Labour Force Survey revealed a total labour  force of 24,250.
The unemployment rate was calculated at sixteen per cent. The survey found that approximately
10,400 individuals over the age of fifteen were not in the Iabour force at that time resulting in a
total participation rate of seventy per cent. As of 1988, the average income level in the
Northwest Territories was $26,400 which is the highest per capita income in Canada.

Government at all levels provides over twenty-seven per cent of the jobs in the Northwest
Territories. If employment in health, social services and education is included, this number is over
fifty per cent. Other major areas of employment include mining, retail and wholesale trade and
financial services.
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More than seventy per cent of territorial revenues are provided in the form of a grant from
Canada under the terms of the Formula Financing Agreement. Other federal transfers, including
Established Programs Financing, account for an additional eleven per cent. The bulk of the
remaining revenues are derived from taxation.

Residential Housing Market

The housing situation in the Northwest Territories is somewhat unique. The territory is
comprised of many small towns and hamlets with the major population centered around the
capital, Yellowknife,  in the southwest quadrant of the territo~.  There are several regional centres
in the east including Rankin Inlet, Iqaluit, and others.

Studies indicate there is a significant shortage of housing. The housing shortage is estimated to
be over 3,000 units by the end of the year. This demand is expected to grow by over 500 units
annually based on current population growth projections.

The economy and business conditions facing the region are positive. Stable government programs
supplemented by aboriginal land claim money are expected to provide strong infrastructure
development programs. The potential for diamond mining opportunities and associated private
investment all combine to provide the region with strong growth and development opportunities.

The vast territory combined with a limited market has resulted in very few banks and
conventional financial institutions providing residential mortgages to homeowners in the territory.
This lack of conventional financing has contributed to the housing problem in the territory.

The Northwest Territory Housing Corporation conducted a very detailed Housing Needs Sumey
in 1992. This was the most comprehensive study of housing needs ever completed in the
Northwest Territories. People in over 14,000 households answered questions about their current
housing situation and fbture  housing preferences. A summary of the results of the survey is
contained in Appendix VI.

A total of 5,733 households identified the need for more adequate housing. A total of 3,584 were
classified as “in core need”. This group represents those households who are currently occupying
inadequate housing and who today are spending in excess of 3 0°/0 of their family income on
housing. This group, with appropriate guarantees, could also benefit from the availability of
NWT-M&LC  mortgage financing. This survey is quite usefbl in identi~lng the location and
concentration of the need for new public housing.

A second group totaling 2,149 households have been identified as having housing problems and
appear to possess the resources to afford better housing. This group has been identified as the
primary market for the NWT-M&LC.

A detailed analysis of this group is contained in Appendix VI. All the housing centres within the
territory have been evaluated and classified as an “A”, “B”, or “C” centre depending on location
and size of the centre. An “A” centre is considered the least risky, while the “C” centre is the
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most risky. The strategy of the company will be to develop a diversified portfolio of mortgages in
all centres within the territory and implement an interest rate premium in the areas where more
risk is evident.

Based on the housing needs suwey there appears to be a clear market need with over 2,000
households currently requiring more effective housing and having the financial means to afford an
upgrade in housing. This is the initial target for the company. The market for residential
mortgages is strong and is expected to expand as the territory develops and the population grows.
The significant incomes earned in the territory and the inability of conventional financial
institutions to sexve this market provides the company with excellent prospects.

The territorial government operates the Northwest Territories Housing Corporation (NWT HC)
which provides a series of programs to provide housing to low income earners and the aboriginal
people. NWT HC is exclusively fi.mded  by the Government of the Northwest Territories and will
not compete with the NWT-M&LC.

The government would continue to operate the NWT HC. The NWT-M&LC may be able to
provide mortgage financing to those borrowers that meet normal lending criteria who today are
using the resources of the NWT HC because of the lack of adequate alternatives. Certain
programs now offered by the NWT HC may be better served by the NWT-M&LC. Appendix VII
contains an analysis of public policies areas which should be reviewed prior to the official launch
of the NWT M&LC.

The NWT-M&LC will be fi.mded  by $20 million of equity of which $5 million will be provided by
the Government of the Northwest Territories. The $20 million equity base allows the company to
borrow up to five times that amount or $100 million providing a total capital pool of $120 million
available for mortgage financing. Therefore, the governments $5 million participation could
effectively produce 23 times leverage in the fhture.

The introduction of this new financing company will form part of the solution in addressing the
housing shortage in the territory. Significant economic benefits will be created by the increase in
new construction. New jobs will create spillover  benefits to other sectors of the economy. This
new company will be seen as a place that Northerners can invest their money knowing it will be
invested in the north and provide maximum benefits to their region.



Business Opportunity

The business objective of the NWT-M&LC is to generate a secure stream of income by investing
in a portfolio of residential, industrial and commercial mortgages and other qualified investments.
The company will employ leverage, as permitted by the Income Tax Act, by issuing debt
obligations up to a maximum of five times the book value of invested capital.

As a mortgage investment corporation under the Income Tax Act, the company will not be
required to pay corporate income taxes on that portion of its taxable income which it pays to
shareholders as dividends. Accordingly, the NWT-M&LC  will distribute annually substantially all
of its net income and net taxable capital gains as dividends and, as a result, the company
anticipates that it will not be liable for any income tax.

The NWT-M&LC  will derive its net investment income from the difference between amounts
earned on its mortgage portfolio and other investments and the cost of the debt it issues. Under
applicable laws, the company is permitted to borrow up to five times the excess of the book value
of the assets of the company over its liabilities (the borrowing base). As the demand for lending
increases the NWT-M&LC will borrow to the extent that the borrowing and additional
investments will increase the overall profitability y of the company. In order not to exceed
regulatory restrictions respecting leverage, the company intends to maintain an operating level of
indebtedness ofjust under five times its borrowing base.

The company will not speculate on interest rate movements. The NWT-M&LC’s policy will be to
match the terms of its mortgage investments with the terms of the debt obligations that it issues to
find those investments. The company also endeavors to match its mortgage portfolio on the
basis of cash flows and duration, taking into account such factors as anticipated pre-payments
accelerated amortization.

The objective of the NWT-M&LC  will be to obtain profitable interest rate spreads rather than
attempt to capitalize on fluctuations in interest rates. By matching the maturity dates of its
mortgage investments and its deposits and maintaining a positive spread in fixed interest rates
between the investments it makes and the debt it issues to fhnd the investments, the leveraged

and

to

portion of the mortgage portfolio will remain largely insensitive to swings in market intere;t rates.
Appendix XI contains a detailed discussion of Asset/Liability management practices to be
implemented by the NWT-M&LC.

The NWT-M&LC  will seek to maximize the return on the mortgage portfolio but control the risk
by seeking NHA insured mortgages. Territorial government lease guarantees will be instrumental
in the provision of financing for public housing. Territorial and federal government guarantees will
be sought and established when appropriate. This strategy will lower the risk of bad debts and the
loan loss expense of the company.

There is an excellent business opportunity available in the Northwest Territories for a financial
institution that is sensitive to the unique characteristics of the north and possess an understanding
of the business conditions within the territory.



Banks and other financial institutions have failed to serve this market adequately. Banks are
prepared to accept deposits from northerners but are unwilling to reinvest these deposits in the
north in the form of business loans and residential mortgages. Banks have failed to provide an
adequate level of semice to many areas of the north and have been very ineffective when dealing
with the Inuit and other aboriginal groups within the region. The lack of adequate residential
mortgage financing within the market provides the opportunity for the NWT-M&LC to secure a
significant share of the market. Appendix IX provides a discussion of the anticipated impact of
the NWT-M&LC’s on the banks and financial institutions currently operating in the Northwest
Territories.

The enclosed financial projections demonstrate a very attractive rate of return and the risk
involved in this business is reduced through the use of CMHC insurance and other government
guarantees. This provides the company with the business fi,mdamentals for a successful mortgage
and loan company. As the company evolves it will be an excellent takeover candidate, should the
Government so desire, for a trust company seeking direct participation in this market.

The initial support of the Government of the Northwest Territories combined with the support of
private investors will provide the capital structure required to launch this firm. CDIC and CMHC
support will reduce risk and provide institutional status from the outset.

The existence of a strong fiduciary board and a knowledgeable, northern based management will
provide effective leadership and a strong business perspective. These features, combined with an
effective marketing and public relations program, will provide an excellent private sector financing
vehicle which should be well received by the general public.
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Operations Structure

The NWT-M&LC will be incorporated and organized as a loan corporation under a legislative
and regulato~  framework established by the Government of the Northwest Territories.
Operating as a financial institution, the NWT-M&LC  will be governed by a Board of Directors.
The board will be comprised of northerners who have extensive business experience as well as
knowledge of and experience in the north. The board will provide general direction for the
company and oversee its operations. The board will be comprised of members who have extensive
experience in managing and operating a company which provides mortgage financing. It will be
necessary to have at least one thkd of the board consist of independent outside directors who are
not involved with day to day management of the company and who are not shareholders of the
company or related to any shareholder.

A northern management team will be hired consisting of a President and CEO as well as a Chief
Financial Officer who will have extensive experience in the north and in the trust, banking and
mortgage lending business. An Organizational Structure has been included in the business plan.

The company will establish a Loan and Business Committee comprised of members of the
management team and a group of independent individuals. This committee will have broad
responsibility including approving all loans consistent with the investment policies of the company
and the general supemision  of the mortgage portfolio. The objective is to establish a committee
consisting of individuals who are familiar with all regions of the territory and these members can
provide advice and insight on specific borrowers and opportunities within the territory.

The committee will take an active role in managing and overseeing the investment portfolio in the
regions that the members are familiar with. This group will provide the company a mechanism to
personally evaluate each lending opportunity and provide an independent view of the borrower
and his standing and experience in the community.

A small administration staff consisting of an assistant and a receptionist will complete the human
resource requirements.

Expertise will be retained to administer the loan portfolio in accordance with the NWT-M&LC’s
investment policies. This group will have extensive experience in the mortgage business and in
the Northwest Territories. This group will be responsible for managing the mortgage ,portfolio.
Their duties will include originating the mortgages, collection, accounting and administering the
mortgage portfolio. The mortgage advisor will have experience in the north and will be familiar
with the operations of a mortgage and loan company.

The porttlolio  will be administered in strict compliance with the lending policies established by the
Board of Directors. The Loan and Business Committee will review and approve all the
mortgages and investments prior to placement.

Several sources will be utilized to originate new mortgage financing opportunities. Direct
inquiries, mortgage brokers, agents, other financing institutions, developers and aboriginal
organizations will all provide leads for the NWT-M&LC.

9
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The company’s draft lending policies are enclosed as an appendix. These policies will be approved
by the Board and are in compliance with N.H.A. and CDIC regulations. Residential mortgages
will be considered in hamlets and towns as well as the major urban areas of the territory.
Mortgages and investments will be restricted to the Northwest Territories. The goal ii to develop
a broad portfolio of mortgages geographically diversified across the territo~.

Mortgages will be provided to single family dwellings, duplexes, apartments, condominiums and
other multi-unit developments. The NWT-M&LC will endeavour to secure N.H.A. insurable
mortgages whenever possible. The company will be established as an approved CMHC lender.
In cooperation with the CMHC, the company will endeavour to establish new guarantee and
lending guidelines and a clear policy direction on CMHC mortgage guarantees within the
territory.

The NWT-M&LC  will provide five year mortgages with a 20 to 25 year amortization period.
Given the location and marketability of the property, an interest premium of .75% to 3 .5?40 over
current conventional rates will be charged. These higher rates will be justified by the increased
risk factor associated with very remote locations.

The company will provide residential mortgage financing to a part of the market which is not
currently being served by the private sector financial institutions. These institutions provide
limited residential mortgage financing today. The company is not expected to disrupt the market
since our target group is not currently being served by the institutions who participate in the
Northwest Territories. Appendix IX provides a discussion of the anticipated impact of the NWT-
M&LC’s on the banks and financial institutions currently operating in the Northwest Territories.

Public housing mortgages will be considered where appropriate guarantees are provided.

The Northwest Territories Housing Corporation has provided direct fi-mding to subsidized
housing, government housing and aboriginal housing programs within the territory. Coordination
between the two organizations will ensure there is no direct overlap for residential financing. The
NWT-M&LC will focus its activities on residential mortgages that meet minimum eligibility
requirements. Certain programs now offered by the NWT HC maybe better served by the NWT-
M&LC. Appendix VII contains an analysis of public policies areas which should be reviewed
prior to the official launch of the NWT M&LC.

The NWT-M&LC  will be a member company of the Canadian Deposit Insurance Corporation
(CDIC). As a member, deposits will be insured to a maximum of $60,000 per account and
depositor. The company will accept term deposits of three to five years to match the mortgage
investment portfolio. The depositors will be offered a small premium of %0/0 to ‘/z”/o over market
rates to stimulate interest in this investment option.

The creation of this new financial institution will provide many spin off benefits to the north. The
company will be part of the solution to the housing problem within the territory.
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The NWT-M&LC  will conduct extensive marketing and public relations campaigns to make the
residents of the north and the investment community in the south aware of the company and
promote the company’s activities to potential depositors and the general public.

The NWT-M&LC  will achieve special status as a Mortgage Investment Corporation under the
Income Tax Act. A maximum of five times leverage is allowed under the Income Tax Act for
Mortgage Investment Corporations. This means for every dollar of equity capital, the company
can borrow up to five times this level and still maintain its status as a mortgage investment
corporation.

The NWT-M&LC’s dividend policy is to distribute all of its net income for tax purposes and all of
its net taxable capital gains, if any, to its shareholders. Dividends will be declared and paid
annually, within 90 days of each year end, in such amounts as maybe determined by the Board of
Directors. This is a requirement in order to avoid the payment of corporate income tax.

The NWT-M&LC  will establish a dividend reinvestment plan where shareholders may elect to
reinvest all cash dividends payable to them in Common Shares in lieu of receiving payment of
such dividends in cash. The company bears all costs associated with the issuance of shares under
the plan.

This structure provides the investor the opportunity to extract all the profits of the corporation
with no corporate tax.
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Marketing Plan

The marketing plan will have several components and each component will be focused on a
particular audience. There will be various stakeholders  and investors required to establish, finance,
maintain and support the company over the medium and long term. These audiences include
investment dealers who may be asked to underwrite the initial equity issue, the various
governments and their agencies which may be asked to provide director indkect  financial or
policy support and private and individual investors who will be expected to invest and deposit
their finds  in the company.

In order to provide marketing plans which will be uniquely appropriate to each of these distinct
audiences, different approaches will be required at different times and perhaps with different
organizations.

It will be necessary to develop and prepare a specific marketing plan to first obtain the deposits
from the public and second to market the products and services offered by the NWT-M&LC.

Sufficient deposits can be obtained in the Northwest Territories to provide the capital required to
generate a $100,000,000 mortgage portfolio within five years. All deposits will be insured by the
CDIC to a maximum of $60,000 per account and depositor. The NWT-M&LC intends to offer a
premium of approximately 0.5% on five year deposits to stimulate investor interest. This
premium combined with a strong public relations and marketing campaign focusing on the
benefits this company provides to the territory should make the company a positive deposit
opportunity for the residents of the Northwest Territories.

The north is currently experiencing a shortage of adequate housing for its citizens. The current
shortage has been estimated in the vicinity of 3,000 units. The Northwest Territories Housing
Corporation conducted a very detailed Housing Needs Sumey in 1992. A copy of the survey is
included in Appendix VI and the results and conclusion of the survey are summarized in this
document . It is clear from the survey that a total of 2,149 households have been identified that
are in need of better housing and have the resources to afford same. This group forms the basic
market for the NWT-M&LC.  Currently banks are reluctant to provide residential mortgages to all
areas of the territory, therefore, it is reasonable to assume that the company can charge a small
premium over conventional rates and still be successful in securing this business.

The market for residential mortgages is expected to expand over the next several years as the
territory continues to evolve and grow. The new diamond mining initiatives are expected to have
a positive impact on growth as well as the creation of Nunavut and the associated infrastmcture
to establish this new territory will create the need for additional mortgage financing. Appendix X
contains a discussion the anticipated impact of the division of the Territories on the NWT-M&LC.

A team will be assembled which will include the appropriate representatives of the NWT
Government and Ministries, elected ofllcials of the NWT, Chusid, Friedman, Financial Task Force
Inc., and various other advisors listed or described below. This group will oversee the
development of the marketing plans for the different audiences.

12
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The company will be positioned as a government-sponsored vehicle which leverages public money
with very significant amounts of private investment. The NWT-M&LC  provides part of the
solution to the housing shortage in the territory. The company also provides significant economic
benefits by stimulating new construction. Jobs are created providing spill over benefits to other
sectors of the economy. This will be communicated by specific press releases and communicated
through the media by a comprehensive public relations program.

A prospectus must be developed which will form the marketing document to prospective
investors. A financial firm will be retained to secure a private placement bringing in the first
tranche  of private sector moneys. The prospectus will meet all the requirements of the selected
jurisdictio~ but will also form the basis of broader marketing initiatives.

The prospectus will be prepared in cooperation with the investment dealer, and Chusid,  Friedman
in order to ensure compliance with securities legislation and other regulatory authorities.
Extensive input will be provided by the Government of the Northwest Territories in order to
insure fill and complete disclosure and to assist in the completion of the investment dealers due
diligence.

Afler the prospectus has been developed the team will meet with potential investors and with
intermediaries in order to test the final package for marketability. At this stage, the
team will be augmented to include an investor relations firm with expertise in packaging and
marketing projects to the financial marketplace. As a result of these tests, some fi.u-ther alterations
to the proposal will be made prior to going to the market with the final issue.

At this time a form of “road show” will be required by the investment dealer in order to market in
person the proposal to the groups and institutions that will be asked to invest. This will require
direct representation from the Government of the NWT and perhaps some people with private
sector experience in the WT. Prospective builders and developers who have developed in the
NWT previously would be good examples of the types of people that maybe asked to participate
at this level.

There will be a need to acquire various marketing services including printing, design, and
numerous others. The company will use suppliers in the territory for as many of these
requirements as possible.

A marketing program will be needed to approach specifically the retail investor market
particularly for RRSP money. This may entail a two prong program with a campaign specifically
designed for the NWT investor and another for the “southern” investor. Since the R.RSP market
is very competitive with a plethora of advertising and promotion campaigns on behalf of the many
firms bidding for finds it will be necessary to develop focused and unique campaigns in each of
the markets.

A specific communication package will be developed to meet with and inform legislators,
regulators, civil servants, and representatives of governments and government agencies including
CMHC and CDIC as well as the government of the NWT and the Federal government. These

13
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will all need to appreciate the goals and opportunities as they may all be asked to participate. It is
currently anticipated that this fhnction will be handled by Chusid, Friedman and Financial Task

Force Inc., with the possible assistance of SAMCI, a public affairs firm that has worked
peripherally on the initial stage of this project.

Overall, the marketing plan will be vital to the success of the project since we will be seeking to
introduce a new concept to the market. Although it is financially sound and comprised entirely of
proven and legislatively authorized vehicles this is the first time the market has had the
opportunity to see it applied to the Northwest Territories, an area in which it has not traditionally
invested.
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Financial Assumptions

Income Statement

Revenue:

Mortgage Interest Income:

The revenue of the company will be generated primarily from interest on residential mortgages.
The company will invest its fi.mds primarily in first mortgages on residential properties. To a
lesser extent the company will invest in second mortgages on these properties and will also
become involved in syndicated mortgages on multi-unit residential buildings. Syndication of
mortgages will be achieved by sharing investment and risk on large mortgages with other financial
institutions active in the Northwest Territories. Other institutions include schedule “A” banks
(Bank of Montreal, C.I.B.C., and the Royal Bank) and other financial institutions such as the
Federal Business Development Bank.

The company will not compete directly with the Northwest Territories Housing Corporation but
may participate in its housing developments and other programs currently offered by the NWT
HC. This method will provide maximum leverage for government housing finds.

The expected characteristics of an average mortgage areas follows:

Principal $150,000
Term 5 Years
Interest Rate 12.5%
Amortization
Period 20 Years

The mortgage interest rate used in the Business Plan is based on the assumption that the company
will maintain an interest rate spread of 4.0°/0 between interest earned on mortgage investments
and interest paid on deposits.

Given the location of the portfolio a premium can be charged over normal Canadian mortgage
rates. A premium of. 75°/0 to 3. 5°/0 over rates in the south could be earned depending on the risk
factor associated with a given property. First mortgages on properties located in relatively
populated areas with active resale housing markets will be assigned a low risk factor. Conversely,
second mortgages and syndications or first mortgages on properties located in remote areas where
there is little resale activity will be assigned a higher risk factor. Mortgage interest premiums will
be charged by the company to compensate for the risk factor assigned to a mortgage.

Housing centres have been assigned a risk factor. The analyses in Appendix VI designates each
housing centre within the Northwest Territories as either “A”, “B”, or “C” with “A” centres
carrying the lowest risk and “C” centres the highest risk. Based on this analysis an estimate of
the number and types of potential mortgages available has been made. This estimate is based on
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the number of households which reported some form of housing problem and reported incomes in
excess of the Core Need Income

Threshold (CNIT - less than 30% of total income is dedicated to housing costs). Therefore, this
group is able to afford to solve their housing problems without government support. A market
analysis is included in Appendix VI.

The analysis shows there are 2,149 households in the Northwest Territory which fall into this
category. The distribution of these households by Housing Centre Type is as follows:

Potential Mortgage Distribution

Total
Mortgage

Market

by Housing Centre Type

Housing Centre Type
,, Al, ,, B,! llC1?

2,149 1,113 427 609

Distribution Y’. 100.0% 51.8940 19.9?”0 28.3!40

Based on this data the mortgage portfolio is expected to have the

Mortgage Risk Distribution

Housing Normal Average Average
Centre Market Risk Mortgage

following distribution:

Yo of Weighted
Type Rate Premium Rate Portfolio Average

“A 10.25% 1.1 25°h 11 .375% 20.0% 2.275%
,,~,, 10.25% 2.250% 12.500% 35.0% 4.375%

“c” 10.25% 3,155?40 13.405% 36.5% 4.893%

*“C’’-Govt. 10.25?4. 1.000% 11 .250V0 8.5% 0.956%

Total i 00.0% 12.507.

*Indicates high-risk mortgages financed by the Mortgage & Loan
Company and guaranteed by the government.

The market rate for a standard five year mortgage from major financial institutions in Canada as at
August 26,1994 was 10.25V0. The average mortgage rate assumption built into the pro-forma
financial statements is 12. 5?40.

The company will charge rates of 11’?40 to 13 .5’?40 on its portfolio of mortgages.

16

‘!!

i.
!



Short-Term Investment Income:

Short-term investment income will be generated by investing excess finds in short-term
government treasu~ bills. The interest rate assumption of 5 .38°A is based on the actual rates
offered on three month treasury bills as at August 26, 1994.

Other Income:

Additional income will be generated from mortgage application fees of $400 per mortgage on all
approved mortgages.

Exnenses:

Administration Fees:

Mortgage Advisor Administration Fees:

A mortgage advisor will be hired to originate mortgages and administer the portfolio. The
advisor will be paid a fee of 1°/0 of the book value of the portfolio of outstanding mortgages to
perform this fi,mction. The fee is assumed to be charged on a quarterly basis and is calculated as
l% of the total residential mortgages outstanding at the end of each quarter.

Short-Term Investment Administration Fees:

The same institution will also manage the NWT-M&LC’s short term investments and investments
in real property. The administration fee will be 0.5°/0 of the book value of these investments and
is calculated in the same manner as the mortgage administration fee.

Interest Exuense:

The majority of the company’s capital will be raised by taking deposits insured by the CDIC. In
order to attract investment in term deposits it is assumed that the company will offer a small
premium of 0.5% over and above the prevailing market rate for five year term deposits. This rate
premium will ensure that these investment products will be attractive to investors. Term deposits
will only be offered by the company to the extent there are qualified mortgagees available for the
company to invest in.

The maximum level of debt will be five times equity. The interest rate used in the projections is
8.5’XO. This is based on the market rate for five year term deposits as at August 26, 1994 of 8. O’?40
plus the premium.

Salaries:

The initial employees of the company will include a President & Chief Executive Officer, Senior
Financial Ofllcer, Administrative Assistant and Receptionist. Total compensation expenses for
this group are estimated to be as follows:
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Employee Annual Compensation

President & CEO $125,000
Senior Financial Officer $ 90,000
Administrative Assistant $ 45,000
Receptionist $ 35.000

Total $295,000

Facility Exuense:

The company will require office space to house its employees and business operations suitable for
a financial institution. A head oflice and several regional post office boxes will be maintained.
Total expenses are estimated at $100,000 annually.

Marketing & Promotion:

The company will conduct extensive promotion and marketing activities throughout the NWT in
order to attract term deposits and mortgagees. The cost of these activities are projected to be
$100,000 in year one, $125,000 in year two, and $150,000 in years three, four and five.

CDIC Insurance:

The company will carry Canadian Deposit Insurance Corporation (CDIC) insurance which will
provide depositors up to $60,000 of insurance per account. The cost of CDIC insurance is
O. 167?40 of the principal value of the term deposits.

Other Insurance:

In addition to CDIC insurance the company will require several other types of insurance.
Financial Bond insurance will provide protection from ofilcer or employee theft, fraud, or other
criminal activities. Mortgage impairment insurance will be required for the mortgage portfolio in
order to provide secondary insurance on mortgaged properties. In the event that a mortgagee
fails to maintain the primary property insurance required by the mortgage agreement the
secondary insurance would provide coverage for the company. Directors and officers liability
insurance will be required for the Board and the company’s senior staff and finally Ofiice
Contents/General Liability insurance will also be necessary. The cost of these additional insurance
areas is projected in the following table:

Insurance TYne Q@

Financial Bond O. 1°A of book value of assets
Mortgage Impairment .06% of book value of mortgage

investments
Director’s & Ofilcer’s  Liability $21,000 Annually
Office Contents/General Liability $5,000 Annually
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Q - 1
Q - 2
Q - 3
Q - 4

Total Mortgages
Cumulative

Total Mortgages

Loan Loss Provision:

The mortgages written by the company will be CMHC insured. It is expected that the underlying
value of the properties mortgaged combined with this insurance coverage should protect the
company from material loan losses. A loan loss provision of 10/0 of the book value of the
mortgage portfolio has been included.

Inflation Assumr)tions:

Salaries and facilities expense have been increased by a factor of 10?4o per year.

Balance Sheet:

Assets:

The company’s primary assets will be residential mortgages. The following chart projects the
number and timing of mortgage investments.

Year 1
10
35
45
60

150

150

Mortgages Originated

Year 2 Year 3 Year 4
35 50 50
35 50 50
40 50 50
40 50 50

150 200 200

300 500 700

Year 5
33
33
33
32

131

831

Average Mortgage Size

Mortgage Average % of
Tvr)e Amount Portfolio

First Mortgages $155,000 85.0%
Second Mortgages $55,000 5.0%
Syndicated Mortgages $500,000 10,0’?40

loo.oOA)
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Average Mortgage Assumptions:

Principal $150,000
Term 5 Years
Interest Rate 11.875%
Amortization
Period 20 Years

The company may make direct investments in real property. No investments of this type are
included in the projections at this time.

The company’s excess finds  will be invested in short-term government treasury bills. The interest
rate assumption in the projections is based on the actual three month treasury bill rate in effect
August 26, 1994 of 5 .38%

Liabilities:

The company’s debt will be comprised primarily of Term Deposits with maturates matched to the
mortgage portfolio. Initially the company’s equity base will be invested in residential mortgages.
Term Deposit debt will be raised and matched to mortgage investments to the extent qualified
mortgagees are available. The company will not take term deposits unless mortgages are
available for investment of the finds. Appendix XI contains a detailed discussion of
AsseWlability management practices to be implemented by the NWT-M&LC.  The balance of the
debt will be a minimal amount of short-term accounts payable and accrued liabilities.

Leverage Assumptions

Zi!@!E Leverage Assumption Total De~osits ($000’s)

Year One 1.72 X Equity 16,684.7
Year Two 1.47 X Equity 28,851.2

Year Three 2.81 X Equity 55,630.7
Year Four 4.29 X Equity 85,255.6
Year Five 4.90 X Equity 97,570.1

Eauitv Ca~ital:

The opening capital base will be invested by the Government of the Northwest Territories with
the balance invested by northern investors. It is expected that investment capital will also be
available from southern private and institutional investors once the viability of the company has
been established.

The following table represents the amount and timing of the equity investments included in the
projections:
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Equity Projections ($000)

* Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5
NWT Investment $ 5,000 $ 5,000 $ 5,000 $ 5,000 $ 5,000 $ 5,000
Private Funds 1,000 4,500 4,500 4,500 4,500
RRSP Investments 1,000 4,500 4,500 4,500 4,500
Aboriginal Groups 1,000 3.000 6.000 6.000 6.000 6.000

Total $ 6.000 $10,000 $20.000 $20,000 $20.000 $20.000

Sensitivity Analyses:

Several sensitivity analyses have been prepared under the assumption that the NWT-M&LC’s
operating environment could change from the Business Plan’s base assumptions. For perspective
the following table contains the summaty financial results expected to be generated by the
company under the base assumptions:

($000’s)
Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5— .  —

Total Revenue 1,802.7 4,784.0 8,281.7 11,599.9 14,341.5
Net Profitl(Loss) 293.2 1,428.1 2,229.2 2,655.6 3,104.9
Dividends Declared 293.2 1,428.1 2,229.2 2,655.6 3,104.9
Annual Return on Equity 2.9% 7.1’?40 11.l% 13.3’?40 15.5%
Cumulative Return on Equity 2.9°A 5.7’% 7.9’?40 9.4% 10.8’%0

The following are summary financial results the company would achieve under various departures
from the base assumptions:

Operating Assumption (1): oueratin~  Expenses are 20% Higher  than Base Assumptions

The operating expense budget is based on what is believed to be the most up to date and accurate
information available. However, given the inherent risks associated with new enterprises the
following sensitivity analysis has been prepared assuming operating expenses are 20’?40”  higher than
budget:

($000’s)
Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5— .  .—

Total Revenue 1,802.7 4,757.2 8,256.5 11,554.2 14,269.8
Net Profit/(Loss) 141.3 1,140.9 1,824.3 2,128.9 2,476.2
Dividends Declared 141.3 1,140.9 1,824.3 2,128.9 2,476.2
Annual Return on Equity 1.4% 5.7?40 9.1% 10.6% 12.4%
Cumulative Return on Equity 1.4’% 4.3?40 6.2?40 7.5’% 8.6%

OueratinR Assum~tion  (2): Interest Rates are Hlaher or Lower than Base Assumptions

The average market interest rates on five year term deposits and five year mortgages used in the
Business Plan are based on current interest rate levels. It is clear that interest rates will move
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higher and lower throughout the course of business cycles and that these movements will increase
and decrease the revenues and expenses of the NWT-M&LC.  However, it is assumed the
company will maintain a consistent spread (4.0°/0) between what is charged on mortgages and
paid out on term deposits. This operating philosophy provides an effective hedge against
inevitable interest rate movements and will render a large part of the company’s mortgage
portfolio immune to the effects of changing interest rates. Nevertheless a portion of the
company’s mortgage portfolio will be financed by equity finds  that will not be hedged against
swings in interest rates. For this purpose the following sensitivity analyses assume interest rates
swing by 2°/0 and 4°/0 both higher and lower than the base assumptions:

(2) a) Interest Rates Decrease by 2%:
($000’s)

Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5— .  —
Total Revenue 1,581.0 4,042.7 6,989.9 9,689.6 11,954.4
Net Profit/(Loss) 240.5 1,159.0 1,893.2 2,244.6 2,641.1
Dividends Declared 240.5 1,159.0 1,893.2 2,244.6 2,641.1
Annual Return on Equity 2.4% 5.8’% 9.5% 11.2% 13.2V0
Cumulative Return on Equity 2.4% 4.7% 6.6’?40 7.9’%0 9.170

(2) b) Interest Rates Decrease by 4%:
($000’s)

Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5— .  .
Total Revenue 1,359.5 3,317.5 5,706.1 7,801.9 9,604.3
Net Profit/(Loss) 187.6 898.0 1,553.9 1,832.9 2,184.9
Dkidends  Declared 187.6 898.0 1,553.9 1,832.9 2,184.9
Annual Return on Equity 1.9’% 4.5?40 7.8?40 9.2’XO 10.9’?40
Cumulative Return on Equity 1 .9’XO 3.6% 5.3% 6.4’?40 7.4%

(2) c) Interest Rates Increase by 2%:
(!3000’s)

Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5— .  .  .  —
Total Revenue 2,024.5 5,499.9 9,576.7 13,524.5 16,752.5
Net Profit/(Loss) 345.5 1,674.6 2,557.5 3,057.4 3,562.9
Dividends Declared 345.5 1,674.6 2,557.5 3,057.4 3,562.9
Annual Return on Equity 3.5?40 8.4?40 12.8°A 15.3’%0 17.8’XO
Cumulative Return on Equity 3.5% 6.7% 9.2’%0 10.9% 12.4%

(2) d)Interest Rates Increase by 4%:

Total Revenue
Net Profit/(Loss)
Dividends Declared
Annual Return on Equity
Cumulative Return on Equity

($000’s)
Year 1 _Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5
2,246.3 6,230.3 10,875.3 15,457.6 19,177.9

397.4 1,927.5 2,878.2 3,444.9 4,006.5
397.4 1,927.5 2,878.2 3,444.9 4,006.5
4.070 9.6!40 14.4?40 17.2°A 20.O’ZO
4.0’-!40 7.7% 10.4% 12.4’?40 14.0%
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Operating Assumption (3): Interest Rate Soread is Higher  or Lower than Base Assumptions

The mortgage interest rate used in the Business Plan is based on the assumption that the company
will maintain an interest rate spread of 4°/0 between interest earned on mortgage investments and
interest paid on deposits. It is assumed that given the degree of risk inherent in mortgage
investments in the Northwest Territories the market will bear a premium in excess of the 2°/0 to
3% rate spread generally experienced in the south. The following sensitivity analyses have been
prepared assuming the NWT-M&LC  is able to achieve a slightly higher interest rate spread (5%)
or a slightly lower spread (3VO).

(3) a) Interest Rate Spread= 5%:
($000’s)

Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5—— —— —,
Total Revenue 1,913.6 5,143.8 8,952.1 12,614.7 15,641.2
Net Profit/(Loss) 401.2 1,775.1 2,848.0 3,553.0 4,221.3
Dividends Declared 401.2 1,775.1 2,848.0 3,553.0 4,221.3
Annual Return on Equity 4.0% 8.9% 14.2?40 17.8% 21.1?40
Cumulative Return on Equity 4.0% 7.3’?40 10.0’?40 12.3’XO 14.2%

(3) b) Interest Rate Spread= 3?40:
($000’s)

Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5—— —— ,—,
Total Revenue 1,691.8 4,397.7 7,611.1 10,588.7 13,047.9
Net Profit/(Loss) 185.2 1,061.8 1,610.5 1,761.7 1,994.4
Dividends Declared 185.2 1,061.8 1,610.5 1,761.7 1,994.4
Annual Return on Equity 1 .9?40 5.3% 8.1% 8.8’?40 10. O’?ZO
Cumulative Return on Equity 1.9% 4.2’% 5. 7?40 6.6?40 7.3%

Operatin~  Assumption (4): The Timing of Mortgage Investments is Faster or Slower

The NWT-M&LC  is expected to write a total of approximately 830 mortgages during the first
five years of operation. Based on the information available we believe that this number is well
within the market scope of the Northwest Territories. However, the financial results of the
company are sensitive to the timing of these investments. The following sensitivity analyses
present two additional scenarios regarding timing of mortgages investments. For perspective the
following table represents the base timing assumptions:
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Mortgages Originated (Base Assumptions)

Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5
Q - 1 10 35 50 50 33
Q - 2 35 35 50 50 33
Q - 3 45 40 50 50 33
Q - 4 60 40 50 50 32

Total Mortgages 150 150 200 200 131
Cumulative

Total Mortgages 150 300 500 700 831

(4) a) Mortgage Investments are Made Faster than Base Assumptions:

Mortgages Originated

Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4
Q - 1 25 50 50 50
Q-2 40 50 50 50
Q - 3 50 50 50 50
Q - 4 50 50 50 50

Total Mortgages 165 200 200 200
Cumulative

Year 5
35
30

0
0
6 5

Total Mortgages 165 365 565 765 830

($000’s)
Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5——

Total Revenue 2,159.4 5,447.1 9,008.7 12,326.6 14,671.6
Net Profit./(Loss) 589.0 1,944.6 2,749.9 3,156.6 3,279.2
Dividends Declared 589.0 1,944.6 2,749.9 3,156.6 3,279.2
Annual Return on Equity 5.9% 9.7’?40 13.7!40 15.8’XO 16.4%
Cumulative Return on Equity 5.9% 8.4% 10.6’XO 12.1?40 13.OVO

(4) b) Mortgage Investments are Made Slower than Base Assumptions:

Mortgages Originated

Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5
Q - 1 30 50 50 50
Q-2 ;: 30 50 50 50
Q - 3 30 35 50 50 50
Q - 4 35 35 50 50 46

Total Mortgages 105 130 200 200 196
Cumulative

Total Mortgages 105 235 435 635 831
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($000’s)
Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5— .  —— —

Total Revenue 1,364.2 4,092.2 7,550.5 10,871.8 14,199.6
Net Profit/(Loss) (76.3) 914.8 1,704.6 2,153.0 3,038.8
Dividends Declared (76.3) 914.8 1,704.6 2,153.0 3,038.8
Annual Return on Equity 0.0?40 4.6?40 8.5’%0 10.8?40 15.2%
Cumulative Return on Equity O.O’XO 2.8°A 5.1’%0 6.7% 8.6%
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The Investment Opportunity

The Northwest Territories Mortgage & Loan Company will provide investors and the
Government of the Northwest Territories with significant financial and economic benefits.

The market demand for housing in the north is evident. Currently, the Northwest Territories has
a 3,000 unit deficiency in adequate housing and this deficiency is expected to increase by over 500
units per year.

The demand for housing is expected to grow in the Northwest Territories. The new diamond
exploration initiatives and the creation and implementation of Nunavut are expected to have a
positive impact on the housing market. The company plans to place approximately 830
mortgages in the first five years, which is approximately one third of the current identified housing
need.

The company will invest in a portfolio of mortgages spread throughout the territory maximizing
the use of CMHC guarantees and will consider public housing projects when government
guarantees are available. The company will seek a rate premium on mortgages based on the
location of the property.

The company will develop a stream of mortgage income secured by residential property, The
loan and business committee will approve all mortgages based on their local knowledge of the
asset and debtor.

The company will provide significant economic benefits to the Northwest Territories.
Construction will be stimulated creating new jobs and the need for many new durable products
and senices  will be evident providing an economic stimulus to the economy in general.

The attached financial projections indicate that the company would provide a cumulative after tax
return of over 10°/0, with an annual return of approximately 15°/0 in year five, to the investor This
is a very attractive return considering the limited risk. This investment vehicle is expected to
appeal to those investors who desire tax sheltered returns.

The company is expected to be very attractive to Northern investors and, once established, will be
a very attractive investment vehicle for institutional and southern investors.
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Appendix I

Legislative Summary

Incorporation of the company will be provided for under existing or newly enacted
legislation and/or regulations pursuant to the Northwest Territories Act (NWT Act). The
company’s jurisdiction of incorporation will be the Northwest Territories.

The Northwest Territories incorporating legislation will also contain extensive provisions
regarding the following:

●

●

●

●

●

●

●

corporate matters such as manner and incidents of incorporation, organization and
commencement of incorporatio~ principal place of business and records of the
corporation, matters of corporate governance, share capital and rights of shareholders,
directors and officers, restricted party transactions.

matters relating to audit, inspection and disclosure.

matters relating to the investments of the loan company.

general authorization for the loan company to borrow money and issue securities for
monies borrowed.

specific authorization to receive money on deposit upon such terms as to interest,
security, time and mode of repayment an otherwise as maybe agreed upon.

liquidity requirements applicable to the loan company in respect of deposits treated as
bank savings or chequing  accounts.

such other matters that may be required in order to implement the loan company’s
business plan and are substantially similar to those provisions applicable under the
Trust and Loan Companies Act and/or corresponding provincial legislation.

In order to raise equity capital the securities laws of the Northwest Territories (jurisdiction
of the issuer) as well as those other jurisdictions where it is intended to raise financing by
trading in securities, must be complied with. The requirement of securities laws generally
include registration of the securities issuer and the filing of a prospectus.
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Appendix II

Detailed Financial Model
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Appendix III

Investment Policies

1.

!

The company will adopt investment policies consistent with the Income Tax Act, other legislation
governing the Company and the Company’s charter documents and by-laws. These investment
policies will be as follows:

i) at least three-quarters of the assets of the Company will be invested in Residential Mortgages
or held in cash or deposits with entities whose deposits are insured by Canadian Deposit
Insurance Corporation;

ii) up to 20°/0 of the Company’s assets may be invested in Industrial and Commercial Mortgages;

iii) investments of the Company will be diversified, to the extent practicable, with respect to
geographic location within the Northwest Territories and will consist of mortgages on
properties located in urban centres,  towns and hamlets;

iv) the Company will invest primarily in mortgages with terms of between three and five years but
will attempt to stagger the maturities of the mortgages in order to produce an orderly turnover
of assets and liabilities;

v) no single investment or related group of investments involving one property or development,
or involving several properties or developments owned by one developer and its affiliates, will
exceed l% of the book value of the assets of the Company, but this restriction will not apply
to obligations of Canadian municipal, territorial and federal governments and government
agencie~

vi) to the extent practicable, the Company will endeavour  to invest in NHA Insured Mortgages
and Other Insured Mortgages; and

vii) no investment will be invested in equity or debt securities other than those described in (i) and
(ii) above

Residential Mortgages and Industrial and Commercial Mortgages in which the Company may
invest are more filly described as follows:

Residential Mortgages - mortgages on residential property in Canada such as single family
dwellings, duplexes, townhouses, condominium units or multiple family dwellings such as
apartment buildings. These mortgages may be:
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1.

2.

3.

4.

Conventional Mortgages: mortgages which do not exceed 75% of the lender’s appraised
value of the property, are drawn generally for a term of up to five years, have a fixed rate of
interest, have an amortization period which is usually between 20 and 25 years, and are
normally renewed periodically at then prevailing interest rates;

NHA Insured Mortgages: mortgages made by an approved lender in which the principal
amount is insured by CMHC, the obligations of which constitute obligations of the
Government of Canada. These mortgages generally encompass a broader range of residential
properties. The insurable amount of these mortgages is determined by CMHC  and under
current regulations can extend, for certain types of lending programs, up to 100°/0 of CMHC’S
appraised value of the underlying property;

Other Insured Mortgages: mortgages which are the same as Conventional Mortgages
except that the principal amount may exceed 75°A of the current appraised value of the
property. These mortgages are insured to va~ng portions of the principal amount by a
qufllfied  insurance company such as The Mortgage Insurance Company of CanadA or

Leasehold Mortgages: mortgages from Ieasees  of real property under long-term land leases.
These constitute mortgages of the land lease and the buildings and improvements constructed
on the leased land.

Industrial and Commercial Mortgages: mortgages on industrial or commercial property in the
Northwest Territories which may be Conventional Mortgages, Other Insured Mortgages or
Leasehold Mortgages.
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Appendix IV

Canadian Deposit Insurance

In order for the Northwest Territories Mortgage& Loan Company to insure deposits
accepted from the public, deposit insurance is required to be obtained from the Canada
Deposit Insurance Corporation (CDIC) pursuant to the Canada Deposit Insurance
Corporation Act (CDIC Act).

For the purposes of the CDIC Act the NWT-M&LC could be considered a provincial
institution. A provincial institution may have its deposits insured if it is authorized by the
province of its incorporation to apply for deposit insurance and the CDIC approves the
institution for deposit insurance.

Application for deposit insurance will be made by the NWT-M&LC to the CDIC pursuant
to the CDIC Corporation Application for Deposit Insurance by-law. The application
requirements are as follows:

1.

2.
3.
4.

5.

6.
7.

8.

9.
10.

General applicant information including corporate name, address, contact person,
date, jurisdiction and manner of incorporation and date business to commence.
Certified copy of company charter.
Certified copy of company by-laws.
Certified copy of the most recent annual statement filed with the province of
incorporation.
A list of shareholders together with a copy of the latest financial statement of any
significant corporate shareholders.
Names and addresses of company directors, officers and auditors.
A brief summay  of the business background of each director and senior officer of
the company particularly as it relates to the business of a mortgage loan company
or a trust company.
A description of the proposed plan of operations of the company, including the
nature and expected volume of deposit, certificate and debenture borrowings,
branch offices, and investment policy as respects to securities and mortgages.
Financial projections covering the first five years of operations.
Certified copy of directors resolution of applicant and controlling entity
authorizing the application and approving its contents.

11. Consents, undertakings and authorizations requested by the CDIC.

The Superintendent of Financial Institutions has the authority to inspect, audit and review
member institutions.

Under CDIC guidelines deposits in CDIC member institutions are insured up to a
maximum of $60,000 per individual per institution. Deposits must be in Canadian
currency and may not be for a term greater than five years.
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Appendix V

Mortgage Guarantees

Canada Mort~a~e  & Housing  Coloration:

In order to make and administer loans under the National Housing Act (NHA), the
Northwest Territories Mortgage & Loan Company must be approved by the Canada
Mortgage and Housing Corporation (CMHC). The CMHC is a federal crown corporation
which has been in operation since 1946 and whose obligations are guaranteed by the
Government of Canada.

Mortgage loans secured by real property consisting of all forms of residential housing in
all price ranges are eligible for CMHC’S NHA mortgage loan insurance. Mortgage loan
insurance can be for homeowner or rental housing. Financing for social housing and non-
profit housing is also insurable.

CMHC’S general underwriting policies for home ownership loans require the mortgagee to
maintain a thirty-two percent Gross Debt Service (GDS) ratio (GDS calculation includes
principal, interest, taxes and annual heating costs and, if applicable, one half of
condominium fees divided by gross annual income). There is no maximum mortgage
amount and the minimum mortgage term is one year.

Government of Northwest Territories:

The NWT-M&LC  will provide mortgage financing to public and subsidized housing
projects where the Government of the Northwest Territories provides its guarantee on
stream of required lease payments.

Cooperation will also be given to the Northwest Territories Housing Corporation in
project development to the extent that guarantees are available.
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Appendix VI

Analysis of 1992 Housing Needs Survey

The Northwest Territories Housing Corporation conducted an extensive Housing Needs
Survey throughout the territory. The purpose of the Housing Needs Survey is to
objectively measure the need for public housing, new home ownership programs and
repair programs in each community.

The survey results have been analyzed by housing centre. Each housing centre has been
evaluated and classified as an “A”, “B”, or”C“ centre depending on its location and size of
the centre. An “A” centre is considered the least ris~, while the “C” centre  is the most
risky.

The first attachment Analysis of Potential Mortgages by Housing Centre  is a determination
of the market size for potential mortgages based on the survey respondents who reported
some form of housing deficiency and reported housing costs which represented less than
thirty per cent of household income. This group is deemed to be in a position to fiord
better housing if made available.

The second attachment Analysis of Households in Core Need by Housing Centre is a
breakdown of households with housing costs in excess of thirty per cent of household
income. These centres and households should be targeted for government sponsored
housing programs.
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Appendix VII

The Northwest Territories Mortgage & Loan Company Mortgage
Originating & Administration Procedures

In originating and administrating the mortgage portfolio the company will follow the
standard financial institution protocol outlined herein.

The process will vary depending on the nature and size of the mortgage (single family vs.
multi-unit) but generally the company will conform to the following procedures.

The NWT-M&LC will conduct an extensive public relations and marketing program
across the territory informing its citizens of the company and its mandate to provide
residential mortgage financing to all areas of the territory.

Once a prospective borrower has been identified the first applicant will be provided with
an information package outlining the lending criteria of the NWT-M&LC. This
tiorrnation  package will include a mortgage application to be completed by the borrower.
This application will conform to the Canadian Mortgage and Housing Corporation’s
lending requirements.

The applicant will be required to complete the application which will contain personal
information, employment and income history, amount and nature of financing requested,
location and description of the dwelling in question, amount of down payment and
permission to conduct a credit review on the applicant. The applicant will be required to
pay a small processing fee to demonstrate their commitment to the transaction. The
applicant will be required to sign the application under witness.

The application will be submitted to the head otice of the company. The portfolio
administrator would review the application to determine whether the applicant generally
complies with the lending criteria of the NWT-M&LC.  If it is clear that the applicant does
not meet the basic criteria a rejection letter will be drafted outlining the deficiencies in the
application.

If the applicant meets the basic criteria of the company the portfolio administrator will
verifi  and substantiate the information provided by the applicant. Employment and other
key financial criteria will be confirmed.

At this point a detailed submission will be provided to the Loan and Business Committee
by the portfolio administrator. This submission will include a copy of the application,
verification of data submitted, the assessment and recommendation of the administrator,
and a draft commitment letter including any conditional items if appropriate.

. :*
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Thecommittee  willthen  consider theapplication.  Alltransactions  inexcessof$250,000
will require Board of Directors approval.

Once approved the commitment letter will be sent to the applicant requesting they satis~
any conditions within a specified period of time. The portfolio administrator will follow-
up directly with the applicant to ensure he agrees with the package and is capable of
satis~hg the outstanding conditions.

If everything is in order the company will engage a lawyer on behalf of the applicant, at
the applicant’s expense, who will be responsible for completing the necessaxy mortgage
and legal documents. The NWT-M&LC  will develop standard mortgage documents
which comply with territorial regulatory requirements and CMHC guidelines. The
applicant will be required to execute the documents under seal at which point they would
be registered on title in the appropriate jurisdiction.

The finds will then be advanced net of any outstanding legal or registration fees. The
applicant’s deposit will be used to fund the administrative expenses of the process..

This process can vary depending on the location and size of the property, nature of the
asset (new or resale), and consideration for other specific or unique factors.
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Appendix VIII

Public Policy

The NWT-M&LC  will be a private sector financing vehicle and will not compete directly
with any public programs now in place. The company will operate as a stand alone,
private business and its lending decisions will be based on normal financial and business
criteria. The company will be managed by a Board of Directors representing the
Northwest Territories and other shareholder’s interests. Several independent fiduciary
directors will be appointed to provide the required business and financial expertise to
direct and manage the company. Lending decisions will be made by a Loan and Business
Committee familiar with the mandate of the NWT-M&LC.

Concurrent with the finalization of the NWT-M&LC  and prior to the official launch,
housing policies of the Government of the Northwest Territories should be reviewed to
ensure that they do not adversely affect the market. The new mortgage financing available
through the company should supplement the government based programs and relieve some
pressure on both finding and direct housing demand.

The attached memo outlines the areas which should be considered to ensure that
government policy does not impact negatively on the housing market and more
importantly to ensure a complimentary relationship between the government and the
NWT-M&LC,

Policy direction should be considered and reviewed for each of the following areas:

1. Staff Housing Policy
2. Rental Housing Policy
3, Agency Funded Rental Housing Program
4. Northwest Territories Housing Corporation Policy and Direction

Each of the above areas should provide incentives for individual home ownership and
thereby positively influence the housing market in the Northwest Territories.
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Appendix IX

Impact on Current Banks and Financial Institutions within the
Northwest Territories

The NWT-M&LC  will establish lending guidelines and interest rate schedules based on the
location of the asset and the risk of the individual mortgage. The company intends to
charge a premium of 1°/0 to 3°A over conventional market rates. This premium will be
applied based on the risk and location of the mortgage property. For example, if the
conventional mortgage rate in Yellowknife  is 10.25°/0 the NWT-M&LC would charge
something in excess of 11 .25 °/0 to its customers. In doing so we expect no displacement
of existing lenders within the territory and thus provide incremental mortgage financing to
residents in the territory.

The NWT-M&LC intends to work closely with the existing lenders that currently do
business in the territory. This cooperation is expected to take several forms.

Firstly, the NWT-M&LC will provide second mortgages where a conventional lender has
provided a first. This second mortgage will provide additional financing wherein the past
the bank may have been reluctant to participate in a second transaction.

Since the NWT-M&LC is limited to lending no more than 1?40  of its total portfolio to a
single borrower, it is intended that the NWT-M&LC  will develop lending consortiums and
thereby have the ability to get involved in large multi-unit developments.

Convential  lenders will be encouraged to participate in these projects since the company
will be syndicating mortgages with other lenders in order to spread the risk over several
institutions.

As indicated the NWT-M&LC intends to offer a small premium on term deposits of 1/4%
to l/2% above the rates offered by conventional financial institutions. The deposits will be
C.D.I.C. insured and should be very popular with the small investor. In order to stimulate
deposit activity the company will implement an effective public relations and marketing
program emphasizing the benefits to the north. These activities will challenge the banks
for deposit volume in the territory. Consequently the banks should be more responsive to
the Northwest Territories given the importance of deposits to their business.
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Appendix X

The Impact of the Division of the Territories on the Northwest
Territories Mortgage and Loan Company

The Northwest Territories will be split in 1999 to form two new political units consisting
of Nunavut  and the Northwest Territories.

The government of Northwest Territories will have been instrumental in creating the NWT
- M&LC which will be an asset of the current territory. The shares of the company will
have to be divided on a pro-rata basis between the two jurisdictions similar to the division
of other shared assets of the Territories. On an operational basis the company will be
structured from the start to reflect the demands of communities across the Territories.
Thus it is expected that there will be operations and activities throughout both political
entities and that the company will continue to provide mortgage financing on the same
basis as before. The jurisdictions may however want to assess the actual loan and deposit
portfolios at the date of division to ascertain the appropriate share dividion.

Appropriate legislative and regulatory adjustments will have to be made within the
Nunavut  Government structure to ensure compliance with all regulatory requirements.

The need for a Nunavut political and economic infrastructure will have a very positive
impact on the housing market in the eastern arctic. New jobs in the public and private
sector will be created and these people will require adequate housing. This will provide a
new source of mortgage opportunities for the NWT - M&LC.

Generally the impact is minimal other than the above considerations.

.
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Appendix XI

Asset/Liability Mana~ement
~

Financial Intermediaries

,.
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Executive Summarv

The management of interest rate risk is a serious consideration for financial
intermediaries.

Interest rate risk exists in many forms, from the options implicit in mortgage
commitments to the cashable features of GICS to the matching of asset and
liability cash flows overall.

A financial intermediary must recognize that acquiring expertise in the
control of interest rate risk is an essential component of maximking long
term profits.

Asset/Iiability management (A/LM) is the term used to describe the. control
of this risk. Today, the feasibility of Duration Matching A/LM makes its use
a clear winner over the traditional’ Term (GAP) Matching methods long
used by banks and trust companies.

The investment manager should understand that controlling interest rate
risk is really only one component of a comprehensive investment risk
management system that accounts for all investment constraints.

While the availability of sophisticated modelling and optimization software
is a key consideration, so is the ability of the investment manager to
integrate the A/LM process and systems with those of the company.

In order to be truly successful in controlling risk and maximizing long term
profits, a “top-down” commitment to the A/LM process is required.
Furthermore, the A/LM process must be integrated into all parts of a
company’s operations.

A significant reduction in interest rate risk and improvement in long term
profits can be achieved through the use of a comprehensive Optimal
Duration Matching investment management system.

1
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Investment Management for Financial Intermediaries

Financial intermediaries are in the business of leveraging their own capital
to earn an incremental investment spread. This spread is measured by the
difference betsveen what they earn on their assets and what they promise to
pay on their liabilities.

Hence, profits in this business are typically described as being equal to:

+

Investment Earnings on Capital
Gross Spread Earned
Expenses and Taxes ‘

Profit
I

The investment manager’s main objective should be to maximize the long
run profits of the financial intermediary subject to the risk constraints
particular to its owners.

Looking at the equation, above, it is well known that to maximize the
Investment Earnings on Capital while satis~ing a firm’s investment policy
constraints (diversification, credit ns~ and liquidity risk), the expertise of an
investment manager is required.

Common sense tells us that the Gross Spread Earned is a function of the
difference between what a financial institution pays to attract deposits and
what it can earn on the assets the deposited funds are invested in.

Most financial institutions understand that there is little that can be done on
the deposit side to increase the Gross Spread Earned. The competitive
nature of the business world they operate in, mean that deposit rates are
largely a given.

The challenge, then, in maximizing the Gross Spread Earned  seems to be
the same as maximizing Investment Earnings on Capital, i.e. purely asset
yield driven. However, ‘where the timing or-amount “of the ca;h flo”ws

2
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promised by the investment or the deposit could change for any reason or
are simply not perfectly matched to start with, any change in the term
structure of interest rates, or the availability of similar quality investment
instruments, will ensure that the Gross Spread Earned will’ not be locked-in.
It could be higher or lower than that available at the outset. .

The maximization and control of locking in the Gross Spread Earned is a
fi.mction of the asset/liability management (A/WI) process and practices
employed by the institution. Furthermore, it is only in integrating the A/LM
and investment functions that true long term profits will be maximized.

Controlling Interest Rate Risk
.

Asset/Liability management is generally concerned &th controlling the
degree of mismatch between a company’s asset cash flows and liability cash
flows. As the present value of the net cash flows represents the net worth of
a company, and as the interest rates used to determine this present value
are dictated by the financial markets and are subject to change, it could be
said that the A/WI function is one of controlling the exposure of a firm’s
capital to changes in interest rates.

It is easy to demonstrate, by example, that significant losses could occur due
to changes in interest rates if the degree of mismatch is not controlled.
However, it is also possible to show scenarios where significant gains are
created.

While the decision of whether or not to mismatch (or whether or not to
take levered interest rate bets) is left to the owner of a ii-m’s capital, clearly
such a decision should only be made with full knowledge of the dollar value
of the potential gains or losses.

If a firm decides to take-on some degree of interest rate risk it should only
do so with the realization that over time both gains and losses will occur.
This has two serious implications. One, the Ii& may not be able to survive
“the big loss”. Two, the resulting variability in its reported earnings will
make the firm itself, a riskier bet to its counterparties.  Hence, raising debt
and equity capital will be more costly.

3
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Controlling interest rate risk will minimize the variability of profits over
reporting periods.

Having accepted the fact that controlling interest rate risk is essential for
financial intermediaries, the next issue is - which method is best.

Term (Ga@ Matching

Term (GAP) Matching has been used mostly by banks and trusts companies
for years to control interest rate risk. The method is best described by
example.

A bank attracts a depositor to invest $1,000 in a 5 year 10.O% GIC with a
maturity value of $1,611. To match this deposit and in an attempt to lock-in
its sprea~  the bank simultaneously makes; $1,000 mortgage lo& W&h a 5
year term, 25 year amortization to yield a semi-amual  rate of 12.0%. The
monthly payment required under the mortgage is $10.32. While the bank
may be satisfied that it has matched its asset and liabilities, a closer
examination of the cash flows reveals that significant interest rate risk still
exists.

Cash Flow Projection

Year 1 2 3 4 5

Mortgage 124 124 124 124 1079
GIC o 0 0 0 w

Net Cash Flow 124 124 124 124 (532)

Interest rate risk still exists because:

a) the mortgage payments will be reinvested at uncertain future
interest rate levels. If interest rates fall, spread will be lost.

b) if the mortgage contains pre-payment privileges without full
penalties and interest rates fall, the mortgage will, likely, fully

4
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partially pre-pay. The pre-payment proceeds will be reinvested at
lower rates producing spread losses.

c) if the GIC is cashable  without penalty and interest rates rise, the
depositor will surrender the GIC and reinvest at higher rates;
the bank faces not only a liquidity problem if it c~not sell the
mortgage, but must also fund new GIC deposits with the existing
mortgage, at a loss of spread.

While there are modifications of this method that match maturity values,
rather than initial values, the pitfalls of Gap Matching methods remain the
same, namely:

a)

b)

c)
d)

e)

h)

, All cash flows are not accounted for. Bond coupon payments
and monthly mortgage payments introduce reinvestment risk
that is not measured.
Even when all cash flows are accounted for, matching will rarely
be perfect and the residual risk will not be measured
The exposure to option risk is not measured.
Gap Matching does not work at all for assets or liabilities that
do not have distinct and significant maturity values such as
pay-out annuities or short amortization mortgages.
Gap Matching allows for only a limited degree of flexibility in
selecting assets to match the term of the liability.
The current shape of the yield curve is not accounted for.
Gap Matching is generally sub-optimal horn a total return
perspective.
Gap Matching attempts to eliminate interest rate risk. They do
no~ nor do they allow for a quantitative assessment of any
potential nsk/retum  tradeoffs.

Optimal Duration Matching

Duration Matching is an alternative method of controlling interest rate risk
that was developed by insurance companies but is now gaining widespread
acceptance in all financial institutions and pension plans.

While a technical description of duration concepts and the measurement

5
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terminology associated with it (convexity, key rate durations etc.) is beyond
the scope of this paper, the general goal of this method is to ensure that
over a period of time, accounting for plausible changes in interest rates over
that period, the present value of the net cash flows (assets-less liabilities)
will not change; or in other words, equity is immunized. .

The advantages of a duration matching approach include: “

a)
b)

c)
d)

e)

f)

@

h)

i)

All cash flows are accurately recognized.
The method provides quantitative measures of the degree of
interest rate risk.
Option exposure can be evaluated and hedge~  reducing risk.

, The impact of asset defaults and other cash flows such as
expenses can be evaluated
Sensitivity testing techniques have been developed to quanti~
the degree of interest rate risk when yield curves move ih a
non-parallel fashion. I
Greater flexibility is allowed in selecting assets to immunize
liabilities.
The slope of the current yield cume is accounted for using term
structure valuation.
The value added by the investment manager can be measured
on a true economic basis, rather than simply the asset return
achieved.
The method allows for an integrated approach to pricing new
business and hedging a mortgage pipeline.

A further refinement of the Duration Matching method for interest rate risk
management involves the use of linear programming optimization
techniques to selec~ from the universe of available investment instruments,
an optimal portfolio of assets that satisfy the interest rate risk constraints, as
defined by the duration, convexity and key rate duration measures. The
name given to this interest rate risk control technique is Optimal Duration
Matching (ODM).

The objective the ODM method actually goes beyond simply controlling
interest rate risk. It is really a comprehensive risk management technique
that attempts to maximize the profits of the firm by finding an optimal set
of assets that maximize Return on Capital while satis@ing the various risk

6
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constraints of the institution. The quantification of interest rate risk is then,
only one component of those constraints.

Given the shortcomings of Gap Matching, only investment-managers that
practice Duration Matching techniques should be considered. for the
management of interest rate risks.

Optimal Duration Matching techniques are the most appealing in that they
optimize profits within a comprehensive fi-amework that includes all of a
firm’s investment constraints.

Let us examine those constraints further.

Investment Constriiints

The investment policies and business practices of a financial intermediary
must be understood and accounted for before an optimal portfolio of assets
can be found that maximizes profits and satisfies these constraints. A
specific list of constraints are:

a)
b)
c)
d)
e)
f)
g)
h)
i)
j)
k)

credit risk limits;
interest rate risk limits and re-balancing practices
liquidity requirements and management practices;
capital measurement and management practices;
any segmentation of assets;
liability (deposit) pricing practices;
asset (mortgage) pricing practices
commitment hedging practices;
tax considerations;
financial reporting information requirements;
administrative procedures.

The investment manager should employ software that can optimize an asset
portfolio while recognizing all of these constraints. Only then will a llrm be
able to maximize profits that are produced by investment methods that are
acceptable under its policies.

7
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Interest Rate Risk Management Issues

In addition to being able to account for the investment constraints outlined
above, the modelling software used by the investment manager must have
the ability to address all of the issues and exposures that are unique to
interest rate risk management, namely:

a)

b)
c)
d)
e)
f)

g)

hedging asset options including mortgage commitments and
renewals, callable assets, mortgage backed securities pre-
payments etc.;
the use of derivatives such as swaps and bond shorting
. the use of equities
the impact of asset defaults on cash flows;
embedded liability options such as cashable  or extendible GICs;
measuring the sensitivity of a portfolio to non-parallel yield
curve shifts and changks in the availability of asset credit spreads
for funds that are reinvested in the future;
the target duration of a firm’s equity accounting for the
inventory of assets for new deposit busines~

Hedging the Mortga~e Pit)eline

One component of the comprehensive investment risk management system
warrants special discussion, namely the management of hedging a mortgage
commitment pipeline.

Since committed mortgages, typically, represent a one way option given to a
borrower horn a lending institution, the understanding and management of
the inherent risks are crucial to the lending institution.

The decision to hedge the risks must be taken very seriously and carefully.

The objective in hedging is to maximize the long run profits and minimize
the variability of earnings over

One must consider the capital

sufficiency and sustainability.

reporting periods.

base of the company in terms of structure,

8
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Risk Profile

A committed mortgage represents an off-balance sheet exposure horn
commitment date to the funding date. This is because the lender has

the
given

the borrower a guaranteed rate ‘on funding. A typical Canadian mort~ge,
however, offers the borrower an automatic rate drop if market rates fall
be~een the time of commitment and the time of funding.

An un-hedged  mortgage lender loses money if rates rise be~een the time
of commitment and the time of funding. There is no gain to un-hedged
lender in a falling rate environment.

#
It is essential, then, for the mortgage lender to ‘“track and manage their
pipeline constantly.

Commitment Phwline Reporting I

In order to determine their current interest rate risk exposure, the lender
must design and utilize a loan tracking system that captures ti the
information required to manage the pipeline risk.

The information required is:

a) Loan funding date;
b) Committed rate;
c) Processing status (ie, pre-qualification, application, commitment

issue~ commitment accepted);
d) Use of funds (ie, if a refinance is another loan being discharged

with the proceeds).

The tracking system should also be able to incorporate any renewal activity.
This is a very important feature since renewals are simply a commitment to
reinvest cash received on the maturity of an existing mortgage.

The tracking system must be diligently updated to incorporate new
commitments and fundings.

Using the Information

9
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Once the loan tracking system is in place and being used. The information
tracked must be analyzed for the lender to understand their true
commitment exposure.

.

The lender must be able to accurately determine what percentage of loans
at the various stages of processing will ultimately fund.

The lender must analyze (and constantly update) their fallout ratios at the
various processing stages.

The fallout ratios will be influenced by factors other than the level of
interest rates as well as the Iender’s  rate drop poliq, to be considered are:

a) ‘Is it automatic or
rate?

b) Does it sumive to
funding date?

does the borrower have to request the lower

funding date or some period of time piior to
I

c) Is it th~ lower of the rate at funding vs. the rate at commitment
or the lowest rate during the commitment period?

d) Is it tied to mortgage rate volatility or market rate volatility?

Hecbing t h e  Pi~eline

To effectively hedge the pipeline the lender must determine the mortgage
price sensitivity. This is based on the sales type (ie. using the loan for your
own account, selling the whole loan to an investor, including the loan in an
MBS package or as a CMO) and the hedging target (Economic target versus
OSFI reported gain on sale).

Then a hedging strategy is determined based on a desired risk/return profile
and the relative cost of the available hedging instruments. The lender could
purchase offsetting options or replicate the option pay off using dynamic
hedging.

The hedging instruments should be selected to minimize costs and optimize
the hedge performance based on the selected hedging strateg.

The lender must establish a risk management process.

10
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Regular and frequent reporting must be developed as required by lending
volumes and interest rate volatility and the commitment versus hedge
position must be marked to market daily.

.
The hedges in place must be rebalanced based on a pre-determined set of
guidelines. ‘Traders Instinct” must not be relied upon. The hedges must be
structured efficiently to allow use of risk aggregation and capture the
dynamics of a “going concern” pipeline.

The Cost of Hed~ing

The cost of hedging is determined by several factors:

1.

2.

3.

4.

5.

6.

,

Lender specific product features: -

a) commitment period
b) Term and product switching privilege%
c) Rate drop policy and exceptions;

Choice of hedging strategy:
a) Un-hedge&
b) Options purchased;
c) Dynamic hedging - option replicatio~

Hedge instrument selection and availability
a) Relative value analysis;
b) Market maker competitiveness;
c) Depth of Canadian markets;

Capital Market influences:
a) Interest rate volatility;
b) Yield curve shape and the cost-of-cany

The ability to accurately estimate the ultimate funding ratio;

Mortgage/Canada Bond spread volatility and the ability to
estimate the forward market mortgage rate.

In any event, the cost of hedging should be considered carefully in
conjunction with the ultimate cost of choosing not to hedge. -

11

,,
I

.

.,



...+. -*

Requirements for Success

In order for a comprehensive Optimal Duration Matching investment
management system to be truly effective, a financial intermediary must be
satisfied that it can modi~ its business practices and embrace. the following

a) the investment management system must be integrated into all
parts of the company’s operations including new business
pricing, mortgage administration and pipeline hedging, deposit
administration and financial reportin~

b) the flow of information between the various departments and
● systems must be accurate, fretpent  and !imel~

c) senior management must be highly committed to the A/LM
process; an educational process will be required to allow, senior
management to understand the concepts and techniques and the
information presented ‘to them during the weekly A/LM
meetings;

d) a champion of the A/LM process must exis~ either the
investment manager or some other person to whom the
responsibility has been clearly delineate~

e) the investment policy should be modified to specifically address .
the interest rate risk controls being used.

At the end of this paper, a chart is included that graphically outlines the
flow of an integrated A/LM process.

Cost/Benefit Analvsis

In reading all of the above, it might beg the question - is all this really
worth it?

Relative to a Term (Gap) Matched strate~, the value added in using a
Optimal Duration Matching investment management system is commonly
understood a significant increase in gross investment spread while achieving
a reduction in interest rate risk. The sources of spread improvement
include:

.3 .*
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The sources of spread improvement include:

a) duration matching allows more flexibility to select assets from a
broader universe of possibilities; .

b) portfolio aggregation, by which assets and liabilities with
offsetting cash fiow/duration risks can be combined to eliminate
expiicit hedging costs;

c) optimization software allows for the selection of the highest
yielding combination of assets and liabilities while satisfying risk
and capital constraints;

d) duration based arbitrage strategies;
e) cost effective hedging of interest rate risk using duration

concepts with derivative investments such as swaps.
. .

In addition , product development capabilities are enhanced as a
comprehensive Optimal Duration Matching investment method allows for
the proper design and implementation of “hedgeable”  products with fonmrd
pricing or option-like features. Example include:

a) Open (callable) mortgages; e.g. a five year mortgage that is pre-
payable without penalty if within the first 2 years, interest rates
fall by more than .150 basis points;

b) Mortgage rate minimize~ when interest rates fall, a mortgagor
can partially lock in current mortgage rates by extending the
term of an existing mortgage;

c) Cashable GICs; e.g. a 5 year GIC which can be surrendered at
any time after one year without a market rate adjustment

d) Convertible/Extendible GICS; e.g. a 2 year GIC with an option
to extend at maturity for another 2 years at a preset rate;

e) GIC rate maximizeq when interest rates rise a GIC holder can
partially lock in current GIC rates by extending term of an
existing GIC.

The cost of all these benefits is measured by:
a) the incremental fee paid to investment manager for A/I-M

services;
b) the cost of any required modelling  or optimization software;
c) the cost of making changes to a company’s own systems to

integrate with the A/LM process;
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